

| | | | Garrison *First Time Bidder | Quality | Ours | Page |
|--------------|-----------------------|-------|--------------------------------|---------------------|---------------------|---------------------|
| 2017-28 | 151 Crestline | PRIDE | | \$ 5,900.00 | \$ 8,100.00 | \$ 6,321.00 |
| | 261 Remy | PRIDE | | \$ 10,400.00 | \$ 11,400.00 | \$ 6,450.00 |
| | 1219 Dillon | PRIDE | | \$ 9,000.00 | \$ 10,500.00 | \$ 7,332.00 |
| | 111 W Blanche | PRIDE | | \$ 6,800.00 | \$ 11,800.00 | \$ 13,615.00 |
| | 218 S Foster | PRIDE | | \$ 6,600.00 | \$ 9,500.00 | \$ 9,174.00 |
| | 305 Wayne | PRIDE | | \$ 5,800.00 | \$ 11,000.00 | \$ 8,606.00 |
| Total | | | No Bid | \$ 44,500.00 | \$ 62,300.00 | \$ 51,498.00 |
| 2017-29 | 262-264 Herman | PRIDE | No Bid | \$ 33,000.00 | Withdrew Bid | \$ 31,500.00 |
| 2017-30 | 44 Lind | NIP | \$ 4,200.00 | \$ 7,500.00 | \$ 8,000.00 | \$ 9,017.00 |
| | 46 Lind | NIP | \$ 4,800.00 | \$ 7,500.00 | \$ 8,000.00 | \$ 11,366.00 |
| | 368 Altamont | NIP | \$ 4,000.00 | \$ 6,800.00 | \$ 8,000.00 | \$ 8,500.00 |
| | 313 Altamont | NIP | \$ 10,200.00 | \$ 6,500.00 | \$ 9,000.00 | \$ 9,763.00 |
| | 240 Clairmont | NIP | \$ 5,300.00 | \$ 8,000.00 | \$ 7,500.00 | \$ 8,712.00 |
| | 246 Clairmont | NIP | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 7,000.00 | \$ 6,137.00 |
| Total | | | \$ 33,500.00 | \$ 41,300.00 | \$ 47,500.00 | \$ 53,495.00 |
| 2017-31 | 336 Chester | NIP | | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 10,270.00 | \$ 8,608.00 |
| | 634 Johns | NIP | | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 7,700.00 | \$ 6,715.00 |
| | 250 Chester | NIP | | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 10,100.00 | \$ 5,965.00 |
| | 204 Sycamore | NIP | | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 8,300.00 | \$ 6,736.00 |
| | 349 Cedar St | NIP | | \$ 6,500.00 | \$ 10,700.00 | \$ 7,875.00 |
| | 556 Daisy | NIP | | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 8,100.00 | \$ 7,740.00 |
| Total | | | No Bid | \$ 31,500.00 | \$ 55,170.00 | \$ 43,639.00 |
| 2017-32 | 24 W. Arch St | NIP | | \$ 5,000.00 | \$ 7,250.00 | \$ 8,120.00 |
| | 322 E. First St | NIP | | \$ 7,000.00 | \$ 6,675.00 | \$ 6,914.00 |
| | 38 W Arch | NIP | | \$ 6,500.00 | \$ 7,400.00 | \$ 9,540.00 |
| | 34 W. Arch ST | NIP | | \$ 6,500.00 | \$ 6,675.00 | \$ 11,903.00 |
| | 151 Sturges Ave | NIP | | \$ 6,500.00 | \$ 9,000.00 | \$ 13,817.00 |
| | 200 S. Diamond St | NIP | | \$ 6,500.00 | \$ 10,500.00 | \$ 8,806.00 |
| Total | | | No Bid | \$ 38,000.00 | \$ 47,500.00 | \$ 59,100.00 |
| 2017-33 | 330-334 Park Ave West | NIP | \$ 30,000.00 | \$ 19,500.00 | \$ 22,000.00 | \$ 23,000.00 |
| 2017-34 | 257 Parkway Dr | NIP | | \$ 6,000.00 | \$ 8,600.00 | \$ 11,500.00 |
| | 386 Springmill Rear | NIP | | \$ 5,500.00 | \$ 8,050.00 | \$ 7,750.00 |
| | 414 Mcpherson | NIP | | \$ 7,500.00 | \$ 9,200.00 | \$ 5,917.00 |
| | 154 Buckingham | NIP | | \$ 6,000.00 | \$ 9,750.00 | \$ 12,400.00 |
| | 196 Bucking ham | NIP | | \$ 6,000.00 | \$ 10,250.00 | \$ 10,750.00 |
| Total | | | No Bid | \$ 31,000.00 | \$ 45,850.00 | \$ 48,317.00 |
| 2017-35 | 110 Washington ave | NIP | \$ 6,000.00 | \$ 5,700.00 | \$ 9,550.00 | \$ 9,270.00 |
| | 498 Woodland | NIP | \$ 3,800.00 | \$ 5,400.00 | \$ 11,000.00 | \$ 7,862.00 |
| | 288 Beymiller Ave | NIP | \$ 5,200.00 | \$ 6,500.00 | \$ 9,300.00 | \$ 6,159.00 |
| | 545 Cherry St | NIP | \$ 1,500.00 | \$ 4,000.00 | \$ 5,850.00 | \$ 5,000.00 |
| Total | | | \$ 16,500.00 | \$ 21,600.00 | \$ 35,700.00 | \$ 28,291.00 |

* Land Bank reserves the right to limit number of contracts awarded to one (1) to first time bidders for the purpose of permitting the Board to determine new bidder's ability to perform, execute and timely complete each contract in order to prevent the loss of funding