


**June 5, 2018 9:00 am Bid Opening**

Contractor 		Quality	Eshelman	Ron Barns	**Masters
2018-11 Land Bank Demo	109 Willis	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 7,300.00
	113 Willis	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 6,500.00	\$ 7,840.00
	32 Bradford	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 8,736.00	\$ 8,380.00
	285 S Adams	\$ 11,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,819.00	\$ 11,380.00
	297 Superior	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,400.00	\$ 7,930.00
	301 Superior	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,400.00	\$ 9,710.00
	305 Superior	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,200.00	\$ 9,030.00
	<b>Total for Package</b>	\$ 63,000.00	\$ 70,000.00	\$ 51,555.00	\$ 61,570.00
2018-12 Land Bank Demo	222 Jefferson	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,800.00	\$ 8,180.00
	194 Sycamore	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,300.00	\$ 10,570.00
	525 McPherson	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 9,204.00	\$ 9,620.00
	699 McPherson	\$ 13,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 11,430.00
	190 Sycamore	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 8,550.00
	599 Stocking	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 6,162.00	\$ 14,650.00
	<b>Total for Package</b>	\$ 59,500.00	\$ 59,500.00	Bid withdrawn	\$ 63,000.00
2018-13 Land Bank Demo	27 Hoffer	\$ 7,500.00	\$ 10,750.00		\$ 8,800.00
	37 E Cook	\$ 10,500.00	\$ 10,750.00		\$ 8,590.00
	170 W Third	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 10,750.00		\$ 15,300.00
	658 W Fourth	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,750.00		\$ 13,010.00
	480 W Sixth	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 10,750.00		\$ 8,550.00
	329 Diamond	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 10,750.00		\$ 12,210.00
	<b>Total for Package</b>	\$ 57,500.00	\$ 64,500.00	no bid	\$ 66,460.00
2018-14 Land Bank Demo	5 Jennings	\$ 10,500.00	\$ 12,000.00		\$ 8,840.00
	4733 Crall/Main St	\$ 5,500.00	\$ 5,000.00		\$ 5,980.00
	940 Hanna	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 9,000.00		\$ 5,930.00
	1112 Carl	\$ 7,000.00	\$ 9,000.00		\$ 7,470.00
	168 Buckeye	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 4,500.00		\$ 8,780.00
	573 Cherry	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 5,000.00		\$ 6,290.00
	306 Second Ave	\$ 8,500.00	\$ 4,500.00		\$ 8,210.00
<b>Total for Package</b>	\$ 53,500.00	\$ 49,000.00	no bid	\$ 51,500.00	
2018-15 City Demo	177 N Benton	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 11,950.00		\$ 11,360.00
	349 Bowman	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 11,950.00		\$ 13,400.00
	346 Chester	\$ 9,500.00	\$ 11,950.00		\$ 9,420.00
	191 Benton	\$ 10,000.00	\$ 11,950.00		\$ 12,030.00
	<b>Total</b>	\$ 43,500.00	\$ 47,800.00	no bid	\$ 46,210.00
2018-16 City Demo	117 W Second	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 22,700.00		\$ 17,500.00
	177 W First	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 22,000.00		\$ 13,050.00
	135 E Arch	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 22,000.00		\$ 12,700.00
	<b>Total for Package</b>	\$ 38,000.00	\$ 66,700.00	no bid	\$ 43,250.00
2018-17 City Demo	151 Glessner	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 20,000.00		\$ 21,970.00
	95-97 Glessner	\$ 120,000.00	\$ 37,500.00		\$ 19,840.00
	<b>Total for Package</b>	\$ 140,000.00	\$ 57,500.00	no bid	\$ 41,810.00
2018-18 City Demo	274 S Adams	\$ 9,000.00	\$ 17,200.00		\$ 7,060.00
	20 E Prospect	\$ 11,000.00	\$ 10,000.00		\$ 11,720.00
	<b>Total for Package</b>	\$ 20,000.00	\$ 27,200.00	no bid	\$ 18,780.00
2018-19 City Demo	333 Second Ave	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 16,600.00		\$ 9,860.00
	410 Wayne	\$ 15,000.00	\$ 16,600.00		\$ 13,330.00
	<b>Total for Package</b>	Bid withdrawn	\$ 33,200.00	no bid	\$ 23,190.00

\*\* (FED EX tried to deliver Master's Bid Packages 6/4/2018 at 2:51 pm building was closed due to no water) Packages received 6/5/2018 at 10:30 am  
BID ACCEPTED DUE TO ACT OF GOD